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Who We Are
Cashbook Finance is an Invoice Finance
company established in accordance to the
Financial Conduct Authority in the UK.

We support the growth of ambitious start-ups
and SMEs who are tired of waiting 30, 60, or
90+ days for payment​.

With our dynamic and expert team, our
company not only provides classical invoice
finance services but also produces specially
designed solutions by taking an innovative
approach that satisfies the expectations of
clients in the best way possible.

Fast funding for your

business in 48 hours!

Get in touch now

info@cashbookfinance.co.uk

Or give us a call

+44 (0) 20 3239 0699

What We Do

Invoice Finance

Invoice Finance can be either a short or
long-term funding option to release cash
from your outstanding invoices.

With the emerging of New Funding Providers,
it is now possible to fund just a single invoice
in order to borrow money against the amount
that is due from your clients.

If you find yourself waiting to be paid for the
work you’ve done, or need an additional cash
injection to help with your growth plans, then
Invoice Finance is the best way to help you
manage your cashflow and focus on
developing your business.

Is your business suitable for
Invoice Finance?

Yes: provide goods and/or services to other

businesses.

Yes: issue your customers with credit terms

of between 30 and 90 days.

Yes: have strong credit management and

control reporting tools.

Yes: have been financially viable for a

minimum of 6 months.

Yes: prefer to manage your credit control.

We provide a financial solution
as unique as your business!
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